NSW ICAC
EXHIBIT 1915

RE: Hi Kevin

From: "Camilleri, Jog" <joseph.camilleri@railcorp.nsw.gov.au>
To: "CAMILLERI, Jessica” <jcamilleri@ambulance.nsw.gov.au>
Date: Wed, 12 Dec 2012 15:03:3% +110C

(/gry good .

From: CAMILLERI, Jessica [mailto:Jcamilleri@ambulance,nsw.gov.au]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2012 3:03 PM

To: Kevin McCarthy;

Cc: Camilleri, Joe

Subject: RE: Hi Kavin

Hi Kevin,
f understand the terms and conditions.

A Big thank you again to you and Wendy.

Jessica.

From: Kevin McCarthy [malito.

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2012 2:51 PM
To: CAMILLERI, Jessica;

Cc: Joe.Camilleri@railcorp.nsw.gov.au
Subject: Re: Hi Kevin

Jessica,
| understand this Hime must have been horrific for you and | am putiing a lot of faith in your dad's trust in you.
Because of ihe extreme exposure for me and Wendy, | want to be very clear on the conditions of my loan.

Firstly, you must not let the solicitor use the funds unless there is an iron clad guarantee from him and from the bank
 that this is the final fransaction and they will not be requesting more.

Secondly, If you can not get this guarantee then the funds of $110k being the amount | have lent to your dad in the last
two weeks, must be returned to my account tomorrow by COB.

Thirdly, if you do use the funds, then | expect to be the first person you repay next week and | expact that you will do
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the right thing in recognition of the pressure you have put me under.

Finger crossed.
Regards kevin
Kevin McCarthy

General Manager, Product Management
UGL Raif , Passenger

From: CAMILLER], Jessica [mailto:Jcamilleri@ambulance.nsw.gov.au}

Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2012 01:55 PM

To. m 4 v Kevin McCarthy
Cc: Camilieri, Joe (Joe.Camilleri@railcorp.nsw.gov.au) <Joe.Camilieri@railcorp.nsw.gov.au>
Subject: Hi Kevin

Hi Kevin,
How are you?
I'm Jessica Joe's daughter.

~ Firstly just wanting to say thank you to you and Wendy for your support and you help during this time. it has been quite
complicated and draining the last few years. '

If you can assist with the $55000 it will help to solve my problem. if for some reason it doesn't or something else
oceurs | will return your funds to you within 24hours including the funds you have already given me.

We are not expecting any problems and the lawyer has confirmed a positive outcome and this will finalise everything |
need.

Thank you again for your help.

Jessica.



